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INTRODUCTION

Social networking sites, whose popularity and number of users are increasing 
every day since their emergence, despite being based on a foundation of commu-
nication, are actively used by users in many areas (Casaló, et. al., 2020). Social 
networking sites that have allowed individuals to experience radical changes in 
the way they communicate (Sokolova & Perez, 2021), also offer their users many 
opportunities to explore and portray themselves (Arora, et. al., 2019). Social 
networking sites, which consumers prefer to use frequently to access information 
to aid in their purchasing decisions, (Sokolova & Kefi, 2020), unlike standardized 
and planned marketing activities today, form an important part of modern mar-
keting strategies in many aspects (Palazzo, et. al., 2021). In addition to their strong 
communication identity, these sites, which are a very important actor in the di-
gital marketing industry with technological developments, (Shiau, et. al., 2018; 
Shareef, et. al., 2019), in terms of consumers offer many advantages such as provi-
ding informed decision support systems (Alalwan, et. al., 2017), brand marketing 
for companies, creating brand and product awareness (Kamboj, et. al., 2018), and 
conducting promotional activities with cost-effective, effective and original con-
tent (Kapoor, et. al., 2018). Social networking sites, which occupy an important 
place in the digital transformation processes experienced by companies, are pla-
ced in a point of higher priority with the participation of idea leaders in modern 
marketing strategies, an important source of advice for other users (Casaló, et. 
al., 2020). On social networking sites such as YouTube and Instagram in particu-
lar, the ability of opinion leaders to introduce the brands and products they have 
used to other users together with their own ideas in many sectors such as health, 
fitness, beauty, food, technology and decor, as well as their power of influence has 
had a significant impact on modern marketing strategies (Klassen, et. al., 2018; 
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