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Chapter 4

PELVİC RİNG İNJURİES

Levent ADIYEKE1

INTRODUCTION

The pelvic fractures are potentially life-threatening injuries with an in-
creased incidence due to high velocity motor veichle accident (MVA). The 
incidence of pelvic ring injuries is estimated at about 3% of all fractures. (1,2) 
Adult pelvis fractures generally are either stable fractures resulting from low 
energy trauma, such as falls in elderly patients, or fractures caused by high 
energy trauma that result in significant morbidity and mortality. Severe pelvic 
injury usually due to high-velocity MVA, industrial accidents, falls off a sig-
nificant distance. High energy traumas are particularly important because of 
the high incidence of associated soft tissue injuries, severe blood loss, shock, 
sepsis and adult respiratory distress syndrome (ARDS). The overall mortality 
from pelvic ring injuries is 9% to 22%, in open fractures 30-50% and patients 
with shock on arrival to the hospital have mortality rates of 33 to 57%. (3,4,5)

ANATOMY

The pelvic ring is composed of the sacrum and 2 innominate bones joined 
anteriorly at the symphysis and posteriorly at the paired sacroiliac joints. Each 
innominate bone is formed by the fusion of the ilium, ischium, and pubis that 
occurs at the tri-radiate cartilage. The pelvic brim is formed by the arcuate 
lines that join the sacral promontory posteriorly and the superior pubis anteri-
orly. The bony pelvis is divided into two regions. The arcuate line below is the 
true or lesser pelvis, in which are contained the pelvic viscera and above this 
is the false or greater pelvis that represents the inferior aspect of the abdom-
inal cavity. Pelvic stability is conferred by ligamentous structures. The inter-
osseous SI ligaments are among the strongest ligamentous connections in the 
body. Additional support is provided by the anterior and posterior sacroiliac 
ligaments, along with the iliolumbar ligaments, which connect the transverse 
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venous thrombosis prophylaxis is controversial and should not be used as a 
first choice. (42,43)

Sexual dysfunction: Displaced unstable pelvic ring fracture has a greater 
risk for sexual life that both male and female patients. Sexual dysfunction in 
male patients are erection, ejaculation and worse satisfaction problems with 
sex life. Dyspareunia is a common problem in female patients. Genitouri-
nary problems such as dysuria, urinary or gaita incontinence and reproduc-
tive problems can be seen in female patients. Orthopaedic surgeons should be 
aware of the common sexual dysfunction, even if there was no direct injury 
involved at the time of pelvic trauma. (28)

Fixation Failure: Vertical shear fracture pattern, obese patients and per-
cuteneous ilisacral screw fixation tecnique have increased fixation failure rate. 
Patients with operatively treated fractures should close and careful follow-up 
after mobilization and at their 2-week follow-up to ensure that loss of fixation 
and reduction has not occurred. Fixation loss delayed diagnosis can be lead 
malunion and deformities with cause significant problems.(34)
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